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Report on Campus Recruitment Drive by Tanishq

Sripat Singh College organized a Campus Recruitment Drive in
collaboration with Tanishq for the position of Sales Associate.
The drive was conducted to provide final-year female students
with employment opportunities in the retail sector. With a
competitive salary package ranging from ₹10,000 to ₹12,000 plus
incentives, the job offered a promising career path for fresh
graduates. The initiative aimed to bridge the gap between
academics and industry requirements by providing students with
direct placement opportunities. The placement cell actively
coordinated the recruitment process, ensuring a smooth and
efficient selection procedure.

A total of 16 students registered for the campus drive, showing
enthusiasm and interest in securing a position at Tanishq. The
recruitment process involved a personal interview round, where
candidates were assessed on their communication skills,
customer handling abilities, and overall personality.
Representatives from Tanishq conducted the interviews,
evaluating candidates based on their confidence, sales acumen,
and problem-solving skills. The interviewers also provided
insights into the company’s work culture, job responsibilities, and
growth opportunities within Tanishq.

After a rigorous selection process, three candidates were
successfully selected for the position of Sales Associate. These
candidates demonstrated exceptional interpersonal skills, a keen
interest in customer service, and the ability to adapt to a fast-
paced retail environment. Their performance in the interview and
overall demeanor impressed the recruiters. The selected students
expressed their gratitude to the college for facilitating this
opportunity and were excited to begin their professional journey
with a reputed brand like Tanishq.



Overall, the campus recruitment drive was a great success,
providing students with valuable exposure to corporate hiring
processes. The initiative not only helped students secure
employment but also boosted their confidence in facing real-world
job interviews. Sripat Singh College remains committed to
organizing similar placement drives in the future to enhance
students' career prospects. The positive outcome of this event
has encouraged the college to strengthen its industry
collaborations, ensuring more such opportunities for students in
the coming years.
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Registration link

https://forms.gle/Pj4bLUXPNcikFkQ29

https://forms.gle/Pj4bLUXPNcikFkQ29

